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FEAST OF TABERNACLES 1993

Keystone, Colorado—Dr. Hoeh

Today we are addressing the questions that should
arise regarding the meaning and the significance of the
Feast of Tabernacles, that is this festival that is also
called the Festival of Ingathering which occurs at the turn
of the year. That is, the time of the autumnal equinox,
the beginning of the new agricultural year for most crops,
but not all, and the beginning of the year in terms of civil
responsibility toward the land. The religious year began
with the- spring-in the northern

Mr. Armstrong for many years asked the question that
you have heard Mr. Tkach pose as to why we are here.
That has a different answer on every occasion. But it is
important that I should answer one question immediateLy
because it makes the importance of your being here more
significant than merely studying your bible at home. The
reason you are here is that you should be able to
understand and learn and share in information not
accessible in any other way or experienced more
effectively than with a collective group. So let’s start out
by saying there is a reason why God set aside the weekly
sabbath in the local community so that everyone would
be able to meet once a week, but annuaL occasions he set
aside on a greater scale. That is, numerous
congregations would gather together to celebrate certain
annual occasions. What is unique about the celebration
is that we involve ourselves socially with one another,
and interact with the community around, and also have
an opportunity to learn particular things about why we
are here and what the meaning is of the occasion we
celebrate; and we do it as a group because we are in fact
picturing events that are going to he great group events
not singular local events only.

When God chose a group of people in Old Testament
times, we call it that in our Christian terminology, or let
us say when he chose a group of peopLe in the middle of
the second millennium before the present era, in the days
of the height of the Egyptian empire, in the days of the
first great dynasty of China, in the days when
Mesopotamia was the cultural center outside of Africa of
all the Near East, there was a group of people descended
from a family that originally had been from southern
Mesopotamia, which family had been reduced to
servitude because they had risen to prominence at a time
when a foreign dynasty had ruled in Egypt. And once
Egyptian independence had been regained, those who
had been appointed responsibly in the administration of
a foreign power, discovered that they were reduced to
servitude These were the children of Abraham, Isaac,
Jacob, and the twelve sons of Jacob.

They were called out of Egypt, and the first thing
they were given is significant. They were given under
standing of a solar/lunar calendar. Moses addressed the
nation of Israel by first telling them about a calendar in

which the month that they had then entered was to be
called thereafter the first month of the religious year.
Sometimes we forget how God starts things. He did not
start by giving them an inheritance in the land. They
were still slaves. He started them out by giving them a
sense of time and what a year meant. He gave them also
an understanding that in that first month there were to
be two festivals, one called the Passover, and the other
alledthe Dä oT il&ièd Bread, in biblical
terminology—later on the Jews used the term Passover for
the whole period, which is not an uncommon custom.

So the calendar was a basis, if you note, for the
determination when certain festivals should occur. Life
in a society is never complete without public occasions.
No society exists which does not have them. We have
weekly occasions, a sense of a change of pace every seven
days, and then there are annual occasions. Annual
occasions are important because it brings families
together, it also brings people together who would not
otherwise be able to meet one another. But when God
gave certain annual occasions, and all this was at the
beginning when the congregation of Israel was founded
as a particular group selected out of all nations, the first
thing that was symbolized was the death of an animal, a
goat or a sheep. That is usually the kid or the lamb, the
actual age of the little creature. It is unusual then to
contemplate that the first thing the children of Israel
were asked to do is to slay an animal, and to take note
that the shedding of blood is fundamental to anything
that follows throughout the year. The shedding of the
blood of an animal became a symbol that there would be
someone who would have to die.

Now, die in what sense? Well, to deliver others. The
little goat or the little lamb was slain and the blood of
that animal was put over the doorway, or on the sides of
the doorway, and any who were in that house at. the time
when the death angel passed over that house, were
spared. Those who were firstborn outside that house
were not spared. In other words, the lamb’s blood, the
goat’s blood, symbolized the fact that the shedding of
blood protected the firstborn from death.

Now it had also greater symbolism. But we will focus
at least on that part at the beginning of the events which
ted to the exodus. Then, as a result of the firstborn of
the children of Israel having escaped, and the firstborn of
Egypt having perished, the children of Israel were
delivered out of the country; and for seven days they
walked out with one time of rest at a place called
Succoth, that is where temporary dwellings normally
existed that you could retire in, in the longer route from
the middle of the Nile valley where the different rivulets
went out toward the Mediterranean, all the way down to
the northern shores of the Red Sea. This was about a six
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days’ journey. And so midway they stopped there and
then went all the way to the shores of the Red Sea.

And during this time they were pushed out so rapidly
that they did not have time to prepare adequate food, as
normally they would have, and so they had the dough
unleavened, and they baked unleavened bread. And that
was an intentional symbol. Leaven is something which
spreads. A little Leaven leavens a whole lump of dough,
and so Egypt as a type of sin—the Bible describes Egypt as
the land of sin. There was no known sinful act that the
Egyptians had not practiced. Every sin you read about in
every other country can be seen in the land of the Egypt,
and things unique to Egypt were there. To come out of
Egypt was to come out of a world that was filled with the
violation of God’s law, which is sin. And so the un
leavened bread became a symbol not of sin but of the
removal of sin. The leaven was the symbol of sin in that
particular festive occasion in the spring of the year.

So we have a situation where the Israelites were
given some understanding symbolically, in the beginning
series of annual occasions, that someone ultimately
would come and, on that very day of the year, much,
much later, offer his life for the sins of the world. And
that was to be followed, of course, by people who having
understood the sacrifice of that Lamb. that God would
send, the person whom we now know as Jesus the
Messiah, or the Christ, we learn then to put sin out of
our lives. That is, if Christ is forgiving us and not
holding our past against us, then in the same way we
have an obligation to turn our back on sin, on the
violation of God’s law, and seek to be obedient to him.

But this of course is only an attitude of repentance.
It does not tell you of the power source that enables us
to accomplish that, and that of course is commemorated
by the festival that we call Pentecost today, from the
Greeks. It is a word that refers to the number of weeks
or days, 50 days, and seven weeks and a day, that were
counted during the spring harvest.

Now it is interesting that I should mention the
harvest because in fact human beings are pictured as a
part of this harvest. The harvest was used in the
Northern Hemisphere of grain, of the products of the
trees, vegetables, vines, root crops, and necessarily of
livestock, the harvest was a type of the harvest of human
beings from this world, harvested for the kingdom of
God. That symbolism is all the way through Old and
New Testament. Now the point is, that there is a festival
which follows the Days of Unleavened Bread, and that
festival is a culmination of the harvest, but how that
harvest is reaped and why that harvest is satisfactory, we
only begin to learn when we follow the story through.

For example: the lambs were slain every year but
they began to be slain on the Passover in Egypt in the
first year that marked the exodus out of Egypt.
Unleavened bread was used by the nation both that year
circumstantially and every year thereafter in order to
teach the nation the importance of removing sin out of
one’s own life, and collectively out of the life of the
nation and the church. Now leaven is generally used
with grain products, thus we have countries in the world

that simply have had no experience with leaven or
unleavened products other than contact with the West.
If you were to go to Thailand, for example, you would
find that people eat rice, they do not eat bread. They do
not use leaven. When you are asked to eat, the Thais
would simply say let us eat rice. But rice doesn’t have
to have leaven. So they would never have had this
experience. The brethren who are in Tonga, they lived
in a world in which there were only root crops. The
South Pacific potato, the yam, the sweet potato, the taro
root, all of these are simply eaten as root crops as we do
potatoes or parsnips or carrots. Now we don’t use
leaven when we prepare those. So the Tongans have to
read the Bible to understand the symbol. They never
would have had such a ceremony in their midst.

But God chose the Middle East, he chose an area
were leaven would be used in order to highlight the
importance of the intent to be obedient to God and to
remove sin and to come out of a sinful world once we
recognized that someone died to pay the penalty for our
past sin. -.

It was some weeks later, in fact it was on the sixth
day of the third month of the year, that the children of
Israel were given the presentation of Ten Commandments
that summarized and defined in broad terms the meaning
of the words “to love God and to love one’s neighbor.”
I’m shorting that. So the children of Israel, in a sense,
were given a great code of law based on an unusual
word. It is interesting, of course, if you hear national
anthems, that national anthems never emphasize the
word “love” as the Bible does. for instance, you hear
among the French the sense of liberty, equality,
fraternity. Or you would hear among the Germans unity,
justice, and freedom. But God’s law was not based
either on the sense of freedom or on the sense of justice
alone, or on unity alone. There’s nothing wrong with
unity, and justice, and freedom, and brotherhood, and
fraternity in its broadest sense, but God’s law began with
the term love. To love God, to love one’s fellow men,
and then to note that that love is expressed by
fundamental commandments, ten in number.

Now once you have love, you have the basis for unity,
you have the basis for justice, you have the basis for
brotherhood, and the basis for good judgment and
indeed, mercy.

On the next day the children of Israel asked God to
stop with that, that that was enough, they’d heard
enough for that day. So the next day Moses delivered to
them the words of the book of the covenant which is
incorporated in Exodus 21 through 23, and that was
given on the seventh day of that third month, which
turns out to be the day that we call Pentecost. And so
what you had was the completion of a covenant between
the Creator God and the children of Israel by a marriage
covenant, in which the Eternal God functions as husband,
and the church or the congregation of Israel as a wife.
That is, God would provide for them. In turn they would
assist God in doing what he wanted done in the world.
What he wanted done in the world is to have a nation
that would live his laws and be such an example that
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other people would be interested in inquiring about those
laws, and that way of life.

So the children of Israel, having heard the Ten
Commandments and the words of the covenant, agreed.
And in this sense, as we say “I do” in a wedding, the
children of Israel said “All that the Lord has said in this
agreement we will do.” And so blood was sprinkled on
the book of that covenant, and that ratified it, and so the
children of Israel became God’s select nation or select
people. This festival, which represents the culmination
of the spring harvest, has a number of significant details
in it.

(1) It represented a time in which only a select few
would be chosen. The children of Israel was one nation,
one congregation out of all people. No others were being
selected for this duty. Now in the same way, the
congregation of Israel later became to be known through
conversion as the church of God in New Testament times,
in which many Israelites by flesh birth were broken off
and many were grafted in again, and Gentiles in the
place of some who were broken off and not called during
this life. When I speak of being broken off I am using an
analogy of grafting in an olive tree that Paul refers to in
the book of Romans. He compares the nation with an
olive tree, and you break off the original branches and
then you graft in. Sometimes the original were regrafted
if they were called—they were all broken off because of
sin, and sometimes the wild olive was grafted in contrary
to the normal experience of agriculture: You see, in
agriculture you take a wild olive root stock and you graft
in a domestic variety that yields good fruit. God uses
another illustration altogether here by taking the
domestic variety which yields good fruit and he grafts in
also those Israelites broken off—but not all of them at
first—and then he grafts Gentiles that came from wild
olive stock which had no access, Let’s say, to the biblical
revelation.

Only this nation, Israel, the twelve tribes, had access
to the revelation of God. God was in their midst. He
was not in the midst of China, he was not in the midst of
Egypt, he certainly wasn’t in the midst of the Indians of
the New World, or of the peoples of Eurasia otherwise.
But in that country he was in their midst, and that people
was beginning to celebrate in that first year the
commemoration of some great personality who would
live and die and pay for the sins of the world, who would
lead the people out of sin individually and as a group,
and who would, in fact, provide for the basis of fulfilling
God’s law, which is the basis of all good character.

Now I will stop for the moment and not go on with
the sequence but tell you what happened later on these
festive occasions. There was an interesting event that
happened, as we all know, in the days of Tiberius Caesar
when Pontius Pilate was, what we caLl in old English the
governor, and Jesus of Nazareth was slain by crucifixion,
and having his side speared, which you will read in the
Moffatt translation, in Matthew 27:49, pan B, that is
missing in the Authorized and most versions. Jesus
Christ died when the Passover lambs were slain, on the

afternoon of the 14th day of the 1st lunar month of thesacred year, or the religious year.
It was later that same year on the day of Pentecost

that a remarkable event happened. The disciples were
asked to gather together, and they were indeed gathered
on.the day of Pentecost, and the Spirit of God manifested
the power of God in their lives, and the people suddenly
heard the message that was spoken in the various
languages of each of the groups of Jews, and
undoubtedly some Gentiles who came out of interest to
the city of Jerusalem. They were people from the east of
Persia, from the west in Cyrenaica in North Africa, that
we would call Libya, people from Rome speaking Latin,
from the Greek world, from Scythia, that is southern
Russia, from Egypt, from Arabia. And there was a
miracle that occurred, and the Spirit of God came upon
the New Testament church. Now, at the foot of Sinai the
children of Israel received only the law, and they had a
covenant relationship. They did not receive the Spirit of
God. That was reserved for another time much later for
the whole collective group. There were individuals such
as David, who did, and Saul, who did—but didn’t remain
faithful—but there was no promise in the covenant that
God made at Sinai for the nation of Israel to receive the
Spirit of God that would transform that nation spiritually.
In fact, God only asked them “Are you going to be
willing to obey?” And they said, on the basis of their
experience, that whatever God says “that we will do.”
They never said we will do it through your power; we
will do it only because you give us the help to do it.
They were going to do it on their own right.

So that festive occasion, to the children of Israel, was
only partly understood. They didn’t understand fully the
meaning of Passover, or the Days of Unleavened Bread,
or the festival of Pentecost. That, came to be revealed
step-by-step. In fact, even Jesus’ disciples, on the eve of
the 14th in the day that Jesus died, still did not
anticipate that Jesus Christ was going to die that day. A
litde before Peter had said ujesus don’t even let a
thought like that enter your mind. We know you are
come to be the king over Israel.”

So it is interesting that that nation, not having
received the Spirit of God, did not understand the
significance of the festivals they were keeping. They got
their mind focused on deliverance from Rome and giving
power to the Jews, because the rest of the house of Israel
had long since disappeared, so that they would no longer
be subject to Rome. That was the state of affairs in the
days of the apostles.

This is indeed a remarkable thing to contemplate;
that the nation that God had called was not promised
spiritual insight for everybody. Now there were some
who had that insight. Moses did, Joshua did, and other
elders did. Joshua told them, Moses had told them, that
you won’t even have the power to obey God, and oh
they assured Moses, and later Joshua, that they certainly
would. WetI, the record of the wilderness wanderings for
the near forty years shows how little they understood of
their own nature.



But God, nevertheless, asked them as a nation, to set
an example before the others, to obey his laws governing
every imaginable aspect of society: agriculture, marriage,
property of all sorts, the proper rearing of children. MI
of that is laid out in one way or another in the book of
the covenant and later on repeated to the next generation
east of the Jordan River in the month that Moses died.
He repeated that in the book of Deuteronomy, and in
between, in Leviticus, the remainder of Exodus, and
Numbers, and also in the beginning of Deuteronomy are
records of other information that was revealed to the
children of Israel in the interim.

In any case, what you have is a nation that having
entered the promised land tinder Joshua, were willing to
be obedient in that generation because they had learned
some hard lessons. Their parents had died not having
learned those hard lessons, and the children that hadn’t
learned those lessons didn’t remain obedient. So,
whereas God was asking the nation to set an example so
that other nations would see what the children of Israel
had as a law, and as an administration, they would see
a nation that had one day of rest a week, something that
no other nation in those days had at all; laws in which
there was justice and mercy mixed together; in which the
two basic laws were defined as “You shall love the Lord
your God with all your heart, soul, mind, and might, and
You shall love your neighbor as yourself.” Now these
were the two basic laws. And then the ten. And
whenever there were infractions there was forgiveness,
when you did not understand, and there was punishment
when you did. It was the one nation that did not have a
prison system, a most remarkable thing today when all
nations have a prison system like ancient Egypt did. If
you look at the laws of Moses you will discover there
were fines, there was servitude, and there was a death
penalty, but there was no imprisonment where you learn
to be a criminal. That is most remarkable. And that tells
us a lot about what is wrong with the method of justice
in the world today.

Nevertheless we should take a new look at what Paul
says, looking back over some fourteen and a half to
fifteen centuries. He said that the fetter of the law which
had been given to ancient Israel did not transform the
nation. In fact ten of the twelve tribes were exiled
because of their stubborn attitudes. The children of
Judah went into captivity and returned, and those who
returned became conscious of their righteousness to the
point that they couldn’t see anything wrong about
themselves. Then Jesus came among them and offered
the terms and conditions of a New Covenant, a covenant
in which it would be possible to obey God through the
power of the Spirit of God and according to the intent
and purpose of the law and not merely the letter.

In the 1930s, Herbert W. Armstrong, a Quaker,
having come to be a member of the Church of God, and
after he was asked to speak and be a minister, the one
thing that crossed his mind was since so much of the
Bible is law, he said, Well, I should think that then the
lawyers would have the easiest way of understanding the
Bible, somebody who’s trained in the law. And he knew

one or more lawyers, because you know there’s always
incorporation and property, and he found that uniquely
the lawyers had the least understanding, if he explained
anything out of the Bible, because the lawyers were
generally looking for the loophole. They were not trying
to find the truth. They were trying to find whether your
case is covered by law or not, and if it isn’t exactly
covered then you surely couldn’t be guilty, and that’s
how they looked at the law. You just listen to the things
that are said today in the various judicial procedures that
are drawing national attention.

So that the chitdren of Israel had no real under
standing, even though they had the law, because there
had been no promise of the Holy Spirit. So Jesus
promised that his disciples would be filled with the Spirit
of God, that they would have a new way of looking at
the law. And he defines this in Matthew—that is Matthew
defines it in those chapters, but quoting
Jesus—chapters 5, 6, and 7, of which chapter 5 is the
classic illustration.

‘You have heard it said ‘you shall not kill..’ I tell
you you shall not even hate.” And Jesus goes on and
looks at each one of the commandments. Jesus, as I have
said before, earlier at the beginning of the festival, was
the embodiment of the law being lived. Jesus did not
come with a Talmud and a commentary on the Old
Testament. He came to live the life of what the intent of
the Old Testament was all about. And he asked that
Christians thereafter should do the same. And just as the
children of Israel would have drawn attention to their
Arab and Egyptian and Syrian neighbors, and the
Canaanites who were bordering them, until those nations
would have taken note of the difference in justice and
difference in the way things went for them, so the New
Testament church should be made up of a people whose
lives are such that others take note of them and wonder
what does make the difference.

As one lady said some years ago, writing to the world
headquarters in Pasadena, we very much find the life of
the men, women, and children remarkable in your festive
occasion, but in a private comment the statement was
made but we don’t understand why it has to be
associated with such an unusual religion. She could not
understand, this lady, that it was what was basic to
religion that made that difference. And one of the
examples of the church today is what you do on the job,
what your children are like in character in school, what
you as parents are toward your schools, teachers and
administrators, and what you are like collectively on the
Sabbath day every week, and what you are like
collectively at a festival such as this. There is no doubt
that some of the young men and women who were here,
and many of’ them not more than two to three months
have been working in this area, they’re new employees,
that they will certainly conclude that you as a group are
different from any other group that they have had in any
of their previous experience.

will take a bit of time to tell you the importance of
this in the case of three or four of our students that we
have regularly sent to Northern Syria under the .... your
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students are simply different. This is what theCanaanites or the Egyptians should have said when they
had seen the Israelites. “Your students are different but
I don’t know how to explain it.” .... It is a fact that
you can be competent and not converted. And you can
be competent and converted. And the unconverted
people should be able to see the difference. You should
all be able, if you have surrendered your mind, your life
to Jesus Christ, to look back on your life and to say
“How do I differ now from what I was one year ago, five
years ago, ten years ago?” Or the lady whom I met last
year who was baptized then 64 years ago. She was
baptized the year I was born, a remarkable woman in the
Eugene congregation. You should be able to look back

The festival of Pentecost culminates the first harvest.
This was to tell us that when God chose Israel he only
began the harvest. When he chose to work with the
Church of God after Jesus Christ came, he did not choose
to work with all religions. He chose to reveal the truth
of God that came to be known and then corrupted under
the name of Christianity, so much so that today there are
many areas of the world that are appalled that the one
religion that teaches love is also the homeland of WorLd
War I and World War II. The one continent made up
fundamentally of the religion of Christianity that teaches
love, gave us the French Revolution and the guitlotine.
Not that everybody who did these things ever was called
a Christian, but let me teti you it was a part of the Chris
tian society, and this has always struck the people in the
Islamic world as peculiar, and the world of East Asia as
incomprehensible. Incomprehensible that it is the
Western World, the world of Christianity, out of which
arose such a mind as Adolph Hitler, who was never
excommunicated from the church to which he belonged.

That ends the sequence of the spring festivals. We
come next to the festival that opens the first day of the
seventh month, the festival of Trumpets, Rosh Haslianah,
the head of the civil year. That pictures a time of the
blowing of trumpets. You remember, of course, there
was a custom of blowing the trumpets recorded in Jewish
tradition with the first of the month of each of the first
seven months of the year, and on the seventh month they
were blown seven times, as also the shofar was blown.
That was the ram’s horn. The blowing of trumpets on
that day was unique in the sense that it drew attention to
the fact that there would be great news created
concerning tremendous events that would be symbolized
in the sequence that now occurs in the autumn. This is
the coming, if you please, of Messiah to announce the
kingdom of God. He was a forerunner, Jesus the Christ,
in time, and he returned to heaven, and through the
church has announced to the world the good news of the
kingdom of God; so that in the 52 years from 1934to 1986 that message went around the world in one way
or another, either by radio, personally, by television, or
publication to every single nation on earth, though not
always was every nation on the mailing list at one time.
For instance there was North Viet Nam and North Korea,

Mongolia, and some areas of the world like that that onlyheard through publications that were not on the Plain
Truth mailing list. But we have reached, in fact, everysingle nation with some warning, some message of thegood news that is to follow. That day, the festival ofTrumpets, in a sense is very important because it picturesthe time when the announcement of Jesus Christ’sreturn will be declared by an angelic host, and a greattrumpet will be blown; and following events, that I willnot discuss today, Jesus Christ will be sent back withpower and authority with which he did not come 19 pluscenturies ago when he came as a child, who had to becarted away to Egypt to protect him from Herod, andwho was crucified by the Roman authorities with the
approval of the Jewish high priests. This time he iscoming, not as a Lamb to shed his blood, but he is
coming as the Lion of the Tribe of Judah, to use a
symbol. He is coming to take upon himself the rule of
nations.

And the next step that has to be done is to remove
the devil from authority, influencing the nations. Anyone
who remembers William Shirer’s account of Adolph
Hitler cannot forget what Shirer said of that man. He
was an illustration of numerous leaders throughout the
history of the world. The ancient kings of Assyria
spoke—it was Shalmaneser III who spoke of himself as
“Thus saith”—this is translated into English from the
Assyrian records--”Thus saith the great snake.” That was
the one speaking through him. Of Adolph Hitler, Josef
Goebbels said that the Fueluer—I won’t use the word
Fuehrer there, I shouldn’t, I say “That Adolph Hitler was
his F uehrer and his god.” To the Germans he had
become the leader and god, for those who were members
of the Nazi party. William Shirer saw the Hitler who
could be cordial at a tea, the Hitler whose eyes glazed
over as he rode next to William Shirer to attend one of
the great rallies, and Shirer said, “What do the Germans
see in this man?’ That was the second Hitler he noted,
and the third Hitler was the one who went to the podium
and spoke as no other German has ever spoken to the
nation. And Shirer said, “Now I see. There is something
beyond the human that explains the triumphant of this
man’s mind over a nation”; that set up the Third Reich,
that nearly it destroyed light and civilization and freedom
for the West.

The devil has been in the minds of numerous people
in power, and people of lesser individual power most
certainly. The devil is the prince of the power of the air
and the ruler unseen over nations. There is a world of
spirit which captivates nations, that can give China ten
years of madness, from 1966 to 76, that can give Russia
the madness and the whole of the U.S.S.R., as onty Stalin
was able to, and you can name numerous others.

Jesus Christ has to remove the Satanic realm that has
kept the world in spiritual darkness, that even to this day
makes people who think that the way to peace is by way
of war. Look at the thinking of the leaders in former
Yugoslavia, and you can also look in other areas of the
world with similar information. And hence the
day of Atonement is to contrast what Christ did and what
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the devil has done, and how the devil must be put away,
carried off symbolically in that goat into the wilderness,
away from the people, never to influence and be a pan
of the nation again.

And then we come to the festival of Tabernacles,
which we commemorate today. That is the celebration of
the concluding harvest that began the many months
before. That is a celebration of what we call, on the
basis of Revelation 20, the millennium, a thousand years
of peace, defined in Isaiah, especially chapter 2, 11, and
probably—let’s say chapters 27, 28, 29, 30, numerous
places there, and then you pick it up in chapter 40. A
time when the world will no longer be manufacturing the
great weapons of war; will instead learn the ways of
peace.

The sermons and the sermonenes and the
conversation you will hear for the rest of this festive
occasion will be devoted to analyzing what the millen
nium is going to be like, what the government of God
will be like tomorrow, what your role in it will be, how
you should live now in order to understand your re
sponsibility in the world tomorrow.

My wife and I will be here for the entire festival
except for one day, and I will be speaking in Vail,
Colorado, and Mr. Weber, who is the guest pastor from
Pasadena, at Vail, will be transferring here. We will
probably cross each others’ paths, hopefully not head on,
but along the way, because he will be here Monday, and
we will be in Vail on Monday. Otherwise we will be
here. And I hope you will pay close attention to the
various sermons and sermonettes, and the consequent
beautiful thoughts expressed in our music that also tell us
about what the world tomorrow is going to be like,
because these festivals tell us of the plan of God that
leads not to just the world tomorrow, but to the kingdom
of God for all people throughout all time, which will of
course be fully explained on that Last or the 8th Day,
which follows the festival of Tabernacles. Have a
wonderful afternoon, and see you, of course, tomorrow.






























